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In 2000, the European Union adopted a Directive against discrimination on the grounds of racial or ethnic
origin. This book provides an in-depth evaluation of the Race Directive and its effects, questioning how
successful the Race directive has been.

The EU Race Directive discusses the history of the fight against racial discrimination in the EU and the
equality clauses in international Human Rights instruments. It then examines the terms race, racism and
racial discrimination and equality in the Directive. The book also looks at the concepts of equality which can
be distinguished in the Race Directive and in the subsequent developments at EU level. Examining whether
the Directive has improved the protection against racial or ethnic origin discrimination for people within the
EU, the book concludes with an assessment of how far the EU has come on the road to racial equality with
the adoption of the Race Directive and the subsequent developments. It also contains proposals for possible
improvements. The comprehensive and up-to-date analysis in this book goes beyond most other books
written on the subject and the specific focus on racism and racial discrimination means a more thorough
examination than most texts focusing on discrimination on a larger number of grounds.

This book will be of great value to students and academics in (European) law, social sciences and human
rights, researching racism, racial discrimination, ethnicity and race relations. It will also be useful for policy
makers.
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From reader reviews:

Pauline Jefferson:

The book The EU Race Directive: Developing the Protection against Racial Discrimination within the EU
gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable considerably more
increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem together with
your subject. If you can make reading a book The EU Race Directive: Developing the Protection against
Racial Discrimination within the EU for being your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your
personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if
you like open and read a guide The EU Race Directive: Developing the Protection against Racial
Discrimination within the EU. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or
some others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Harold Riggs:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as
in the outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually The EU Race Directive: Developing the Protection
against Racial Discrimination within the EU why because the excellent cover that make you consider with
regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or
maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Eugene Flowers:

The book untitled The EU Race Directive: Developing the Protection against Racial Discrimination within
the EU contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is
very straightforward all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
authored by famous author. The author brings you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this
book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book throughout
anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-
site along with order it. Have a nice read.

Rachel Haley:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The EU Race Directive: Developing the
Protection against Racial Discrimination within the EU can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book
you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek
activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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